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During this session, Barbara Stacher, project officer 
of the EU-Commission, introduced several calls for 
artists and creative people with relevance for Crea-
tive Hubs: 

As Barbara noted during the session, it is  very 
important for hubs participating in different propos-
als also to build in some components in support 
of the  Network as such. She also suggested  that 
Creative Europe desks and also Horizon Desks  all 
over Europe can help to provide applicants with the 
necessary information, help with drafting and finding 
partners. Barbara discussed with the participants 
their experience with Erasmus+, H2020, STARTS, 
COSME, Worth and the StartUp Europe pro-
gramme. She also explained different new initiatives 
concerning mobility schemes for artists and creative 
professionals, different pilot projects and smaller 
actions  and upcoming calls.

Barbara also talked about the future of different 
funding programmes and which could be interesting 
for creative hubs. Deadlines, budget information etc. 
of the above opportunities are all included in  
Barbara’s presentation.

https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1afSR8tB-d3eGpzj-bzG8EsBtH6yXX65Q


CreativeFLIP.eu CreativeFLIP_EUwww.creativeflip.eu 

Finance 
Learning
Innovation
Patenting

crea tive


